Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Race and Anti-Racism Training
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

1. Do schools in your authority currently receive training in race and anti-racism?
Answer:

Individual schools determine whether or not to access training in race and anti-racism.  This may be part of their RSE (relationships and sex education) curriculum.  
The Council encourages schools to access racial literacy training. 

2. If yes: 
a) Is this training mandatory?
No

b) Is the training conducted by a specialist external provider?
This is up to schools.
c) Is the training conducted by somebody already employed by the school providing the training?
Not known.  The Council does not hold this information and as such this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act -information not held.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
