Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Exempt accommodation
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

I am seeking information relating to accommodation that has been classed as 'exempt'. 

I am seeking the housing benefit paid for such accommodation, broken down into housing benefit, and to include service charges as outlined below. 

Exempt accommodation is defined as: "1) “Exempt accommodation” is a term used in Housing Benefit and Universal Credit to describe supported accommodation where the rules that normally limit the amount of rent covered by a benefit award do not apply. The usual meaning of “exempt accommodation” is where the accommodation is provided by a landlord in the social or voluntary sector and the benefit claimant is provided with care, support or supervision by the landlord or by someone acting on the landlord’s behalf. A claimant occupying exempt accommodation does not have their housing benefit restricted to local housing allowance." 

Please can you disclose the following:
1. details of the lowest awarded eligible core rent; 
2. details of the highest awarded eligible core rent; 

Answer:

In respect of Qs. 1 & 2 above, the information is not recorded on our system.  There is no split recorded between “core” rent and eligible service charges. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

3. details of the lowest awarded gross eligible rent (i.e. inclusive of the core rent and the eligible service charges); 

£37.01 per week - As of 01 June 2022 
4. details of the highest awarded gross eligible rent (i.e. inclusive of the core rent and the eligible service charges); and 

£502.20 per week - As of 01 June 2022
5. Please confirm the names of exempt accommodation providers in your area. Please name the providers/landlords who currently hold exempt accommodation status in respect of any of their residents.

See attached
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
