Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Can I please have the following information for each of the following calendar years: 2018, 2019, 2020, 2021. For 2021 can I please have the information for the period from 1 January to 31 August.


1. How many dogs entered pounds (also known as kennels or animal shelters) in your area?

2. How many of these dogs were euthanised? 

3. For each dog that was euthanised, can you provide the reason?

And if possible within the cost threshold, can you also provide the following information for each of these calendar years:

4. How many were reclaimed by their owners?

5. How many were passed to a welfare organisation?

6. How many were rehomed?

Please can you break down the figures for each calendar year.
	
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021-Jan to July

	How many dogs entered pounds in your area?
	200
	207
	85
	72

	How many of these were euthanised?
	1
	5
	3
	1

	For each dog that was euthanised, can you provide the reason?
	Not suitable for rehoming 
	2-illness

3- Not suitable for rehoming
	Not suitable for rehoming
	Not suitable for rehoming 

	How many were claimed by their owner?
	134
	122
	102
	60

	How many were passed to a welfare organisation?
	Not held
	Not held
	Not held
	Not held

	How many were rehomed?
	Not held
	Not held
	Not held
	Not held.


In response to questions 5 and 6.  

The Council does not hold this information. The dogs are only the responsibility of the Council as strays for 7 days, on the 8th day the ownership and responsibility passes to the kennels.   

This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
