Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Energy compliance, private-rented housing
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am writing to you to request some information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, regarding Energy Performance Certificates (EPCs) and compliance with Minimum Energy Efficiency Standards (MEES) in private-rented housing in your area. More specifically, we would like answers to the following questions: 

Private-rented and HMO properties 

1. How many properties do you have in total registered as meeting House of Multiple Occupancy (HMO) compliance regulations? 

2. How many properties do you have in total registered in your area as being privately rented? This includes both HMO and non-HMO private-rented properties. 

Answer:

With regard to Qs.1 & 2, the council does not hold a register.  This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, the information requested is not held by Leicester City Council.


MEES Compliance: 

1. How many MEES Compliance Notices have you served in the last 12 months? 

None


2. Of these notices served, how many Compliance Notices resulted in a confirmed breach of regulation? 

N/A


3. How many of these breaches resulted in the issue of a fine? 

N/A


4. What was the total penalty amount for each confirmed breach? 

N/A


EPCs: 

1. How many properties have registered for an EPC exemption, and where available, what are the reasons for these exemptions? 

This is a general government register, not local authority.

2. How many rented properties do you have on record with each EPC Grade? To be clear, this is a breakdown for how many properties you have with each EPC Grade, ranging from A-G inclusive. 

3. How many HMO properties do you currently have registered as renting without a valid EPC? 

In respect of Qs.2 & 3, we do not hold this data, therefore this is exempt under section 1.1 of the Act -information not held.

Energy Efficiency: 

1. Does your local authority offer support for landlords to upgrade their properties to be more energy efficient? 
Yes

a. If yes, what support is available? 
Warm Homes Local Grants (WHLG)  

And what budget does your local authority allocate to this support? 

Total funding for WHLG over 3 years is approx. £4.5m (funding runs until 30/03/2028) but these funds are available to both private owner occupied and private rented tenures, so there is no specific portion of this allocated to landlords/tenants (it is allocated on first come first served basis between both tenures).

2. Does your local authority offer support for private-rented tenants to upgrade their properties to be more energy efficient?
Yes
 
a. If yes, what support is available? 
Warm Homes Local Grants (WHLG)  

And what budget does your local authority allocate to this support? 

As above – approx. £4.5m available on first come first served basis, for all private owner occupied and private rented homes.

3. Does your local authority offer support for private-rented tenants to support them to pay high energy bills?
Not specifically, however, through the Household Support Fund, Leicester residents can apply for support with electricity and gas costs or to the Community Support Grants for crisis (same day) support.

 
a. If yes, what support is available? And what budget does your local authority allocate to this support? 

Financial support is available through the Household Support Fund (£1.2m) and the Community Support Grant Service (£395k) which includes support for food, electricity and gas).

For the above, we are defining ‘support’ as including both any advisory and financial measures that your authority takes in reference to the people and subject of the questions. 

Where data may be available to go alongside a response, please include this. If partial/only some information is available, please still share this information. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
